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The special purpose file cabinet is
expensed by the use of Form
4562 (Depreciation and
Amortization). Use Part I of this
form, and when the $4,800 listed
on Line 12 is combined with the
depreciation on the Infiniti SUV
(see below), the total is
transferred to Schedule C.
Depreciation on the Infiniti under
the MACRS method is computed
as follows:
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“Comprehensive Tax Return
Problems”
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The tax is reasonably fair in that
the high-income taxpayers pay
the most tax, the low-income
taxpayers the least tax. While tax
laws are constantly changing,
most taxpayers have a pretty
good idea of what their taxes are
going to be for the tax year and
the federal income tax does
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