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John Adams, 21 years away from
taking the presidential oath, said on
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Oxford celebrates July 4th for the kids
As scorching hot weather in the area
begins to cool down, Oxford is
preparing to enjoy another
Independence Day. The celebration
begins Saturday, as the traditional
parade returns to the city after a ...

Oxford prepares for Independence
Day festivities
Crawford pitched 5 1/3 innings
Monday in relief after the Red Sox
were forced to improvise because
Michael Wacha was unavailable.

Red Sox notebook: Kutter Crawford
provides Boston with a lift
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Oklahoma Union crashed through the
portal — first to qualify for the Class 2A
state tourney and second to win the
Gold Ball ... were coached by Lee Ott —
burst to ...

TOP 20 COUNTDOWN, NO. 5: OUHS
Cougars made extraordinary effort for
title two-peat bid
The murder trial of school shooting
suspect Ethan Crumbley has been
delayed by four months as his defense
team convinced a judge Thursday that
it needed more time to go through the
massive amount ...

Oxford High School shooting suspect
Ethan Crumbley's trial delayed 4
months
A Virgin Orbit rocket carrying seven
U.S. Defense Department satellites
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